
A G E N D A   N O T E S 
Gorham Town Council Regular Meeting 

June 12, 2020 – 6:30pm 
Burleigh H. Loveitt Council Chambers 

 
 
Public 
Hearing # 1 
 
On Item #2020-06-08 Public Hearing on the proposed 2020-2021 Fiscal Year Budget for the Gorham 
School District. (Admin. Spon.) 
 
Public hearing and order on the proposed Gorham School Department Budget for FY2021. The Gorham Town 
Council has the authority to set the total amount going to voter validation referendum on July 14, 2020, but not 
to cut specific items.  
 
The budget before the Council for a vote has been revised since your workshop with the School Committee and 
is not anticipated to increase the municipal mil rate for FY2021.  
 
The Gorham School Superintendent, School Committee Members and School Staff will be available during your 
meeting to answer any questions.  
 
 
Public 
Hearing #2 
 
On Item# 2020-06-09 Public Hearing on the proposed 2020 -2021 Fiscal Year Budget for the Town of 
Gorham. (Admin. Spon.) 
 
 
Public hearing and order on the proposed Town of Gorham Budget for FY2021. As proposed, the budget for 
FY2021 does not increase the mil rate for FY2021 and would decrease it by .01 mils. County taxes have an 
increase of 7.4% which would impact the mil rate by .04 and overall by .03 when combined with the negative 
municipal budget. As the overall new valuation for the Town will not be solidified before the budget vote, it is 
likely that the small increase from the County may be covered by new valuation.  
 
Traditionally, the Town Council will debate the merits and/or amend the budget before a final vote during this 
item. As the meeting will be conducted remotely, I would ask the Council to call a recess after any changes are 
made (if any) to allow our Finance Director time to double check figures and to confirm the actions of the 
Council before the final vote. This should take less than ten minutes.   
 
There is a minor typo in the cost of police cruisers in Capital Part II of the proposed budget that I will ask the 
Council to approve as a change with the specifics being emailed before the meeting. It would also be helpful for 
staff if the Council is looking to make any changes to either run them through the Council Chair before the 
meeting or email to me so that we can work through the numbers before the meeting.   
 
Staff is also analyzing the curbside collection bids as to whether or not those line items need to be adjusted or if 
we can carry the new contract this year utilizing reserve funds.  
 
 
 



Item #2020-06-10  
 
Action to consider authorizing the Town Manager to enter into a waste and recycling hauling contracts. 
(Councilor Phillips Spon.) 
 
On July 1st of this year, the Town’s waste / recycling hauling contract with RW Herrick will expire. For some past 
contracts, the Town would renegotiate rather than go out to a full bid for hauling services. This spring, RW 
Herrick announced that it did not want to renew its contract with the Town. Staff went out to bid for services, 
which include collection for curbside waste / recycling, as well as a separate contract for pickup of waste / 
recycling materials at municipal facilities and bulky waste curbside collection.  
 
Casella was the only bid on curbside collection despite five companies taking out bid packages. They bid an 
option for normal collection with employees by hand, as well as an option for mechanical arms and totes with 
the pricing the same. For year one of the new contract, the cost would be $620,434, or $5,434 over what had 
been budgeted in the proposed FY2021 budget. Casella also bid municipal collection; however, RW Herrick 
provided for a lower bid price on that service.  
 
This proposed order allows the Town Manager to enter into contracts of up to five years with the vendors for 
collection and hauling services. The bids and bid document are attached, as well as a memo from Public Works 
Director Robert Burns. If approved, Casella would start collection on July 1st through manual collection. If the 
Town elected in the near future to go with mechanical arms and totes, Casella would order the necessary 
vehicles and tote collection would start at a later date, perhaps as much as a year. Casella would bear the cost of 
the purchase of all totes initially within the Town.  
 
Curbside collection is funded in the Town of Gorham through the sale of bags and tags. It is very important to 
note that a change in this system could substantially affect revenues that pay for curbside collection. Tote 
collection by nature with the sale of bags has the potential to be abused more than manual collection. The Town 
would also expect to see a downward trend on the quality of its recycling program as the totes are not 
physically inspected by hand before being collected. Before committing to either manual or mechanical 
collection, Town staff recommend that either option be vetted over the next several months for long term 
impacts before the Council makes a decision on which option you would like to pursue.  
 



 
 

 

 

 

MEMORANDUM 
 
 
TO:  Ephrem Paraschak 
FROM: Bob Burns 
DATE: June 12, 2020 
CC:  File 
 
RE:  Municipal Solid Waste and Recyclable Material Curbside Collection Bid Award 

 
On Tuesday March 31st of this year Town staff were advised that RW Herrick, Inc desired not to 
renew their contract for the curbside collection of residential solid waste and recyclable material that 
ends effective June 30, 2020.  In my opinion the Town staff and all customers were fortunate to have 
18 years of extremely reliable performance from this contractor at an affordable rate. 
 
The Invitation to Bid 
Basic research was conducted with inquiries made to surrounding towns about their respective trash 
and recycling programs and recent bid results and contact was made with ecomaine for a complete 
list of likely contractors.  The Town bid consisted of three alternates with three parts each.   
 
Alternate 1 was to continue the Town’s current curbside collection program as-is for three years with 
a part for the cost of the curbside collection, a part for the cost of municipal buildings collection, and a 
part for the cost of curbside collection of bulky waste items.   
 
Alternate 2 was to continue the Town’s current program for five years with  the same three parts as 
Alternate 1. 
 
Alternate 3 was to change to a mechanical arm collection system for five years with the same three 
parts as Alternate 2 and 3.  Town trash bags would still have to be utilized with this approach. 
 
The invitation to bid was issued on Monday, May 4th and was sent directly to all companies that haul 
waste and/or recyclables to ecomaine.  A mandatory pre-bid meeting occurred on Monday, May 11th 
that included five participants.  Three bids were opened publicly and read aloud on Monday, June 1st 
at 10:00AM.  The bidders and bid results are shown in the attached table.  
 
Pros and Cons to the Alternates    
 
Alternate 1 and 2  As these approaches are a mirror of our current system, the Council is already 
aware of the pros and cons, but I’ll go over them anyway: 

Town of Gorham 
PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT 

80 Huston Road 

 
Mailing Address: 

75 South Street, Suite 1 

Gorham, Maine 04038-1382 

 

Tel. (207) 892-9062 

Fax (207) 893-2092  
www.gorham-me.org 

 

 

 

                 Robert Burns, P.E.       

          Public Works Director 

         rburns@gorham.me.us 
            

                          

 

                        Terry Deering 

                       Deputy Director 

          tdeering@gorham.me.us 

 

 

Item # 2020-06-10



 Pros  The pay as you throw system is already established in Gorham and has an 18 year 
history.  It generates over $570,000 of annual revenue that offsets the cost for the curbside collection.  
Residents understand the system by and large and are familiar with it.  It promotes a high recycle rate 
and is a good system to police for contaminated recyclables which now have a very high cost of 
disposal at ecomaine. 
 Cons  The quality of the Town trash bags has been a topic of much debate and the 
procurement and acquisition of trash bags by Public Works has been a challenge at times.  The trash 
bag tags do show some promise in alleviating this issue.  Some residents have at times expressed 
frustrations that no container is provided for their trash and they would like a wheeled cart similar to 
neighboring towns. 
 
Alternate 3 
 Pros  The user is provided wheeled carts for trash and recyclables.  If you happen to be a user 
that can live within the provided cart volume for the disposal of your trash and recyclables then this is 
a good thing. 
 Cons  There is a history of high contamination rates in the recycle stream from towns that use 
this system.  Westbrook, Scarborough and Kennebunk have all seen their annual costs for recycling 
increase above the $35/ton that Gorham pays.  Kennebunk has retained the use of town trash bags 
along with the carts, but policing this has proven difficult and their revenues have dropped.  Residents 
who produce more trash or recyclables than the carts can hold have the need for further disposal 
which will not be an option with this program, unless more carts are provided in some manner.  
 
Bid Results 
As can be seen in the attached table, only Casella Waste submitted a complete bid.  RW Herrick did 
provide a partial bid on the municipal buildings collection with exceptions.  Casella has indicated that 
if Alternate 3 is selected that they will be collecting the first year with the current trash bag system 
until they can order and receive mechanical arm collection trucks. 
 
My recommendation 
If the Town Council wants to continue with our existing program, I recommend award of Alternate 2 
part one to Casella Waste and part two to RW Herrick.  The RW Herrick part two costs are being re-
worked to include the rest of the locations that they sought exception for and I hope to have them 
available for the Council meeting.   
 
If the Town Council wants to pursue the mechanical arm collection option of Alternate 3 I recommend 
that we have a workshop or two to go over the variables and concerns regarding a net increase in the 
total costs of the program.  I have discussed this with Casella Waste and they are agreeable with 
collecting for several months at the Alternate 2 rate per month while we make a determination.  RW 
Herrick can still be awarded the part two section.  
 
     
 
 
 
 
 



Municipal Solid Waste and Recylable Material Curbside Collection Services Including Municipal Buildings

Bid Results

June 1, 2020

Casella Waste Waste Management RW Herrick

Alternate #1
Year 1

Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 620,434.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 50,000.00$   No Bid No Bid

Bulky Item Collection 125.00$         per hour No Bid No Bid

Year 2

Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 634,692.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 51,500.00$   No Bid No Bid

Bulky Item Collection 131.25$         per hour No Bid No Bid

Year 3

Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 649,378.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 53,045.00$   No Bid No Bid

Bulky Item Collection 137.00$         per hour No Bid No Bid

Alternate #2
Year 1

Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 625,225.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 50,000.00$   No Bid No Bid

Bulky Item Collection 125.00$         per hour No Bid No Bid

Year 2

Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 643,982.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 51,500.00$   No Bid No Bid

Bulky Item Collection 131.25$         per hour No Bid No Bid

Year 3

Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 663,301.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 53,045.00$   No Bid No Bid

Bulky Item Collection 137.81$         per hour No Bid No Bid

Year 4

Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 683,200.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 54,636.00$   No Bid No Bid

Bulky Item Collection 144.70$         per hour No Bid No Bid

1 of 2



Municipal Solid Waste and Recylable Material Curbside Collection Services Including Municipal Buildings

Bid Results

June 1, 2020

Year 5

Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 703,696.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 56,275.00$   No Bid No Bid

Bulky Item Collection 151.94$         per hour No Bid No Bid

Alternate #3
Year 1

Mechanical Arm Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 620,434.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 50,000.00$   No Bid 6,500.00$ 

Bulky Item Collection 125.00$         per hour No Bid No Bid

Year 2

Mechanical Arm Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 634,692.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 51,500.00$   No Bid 6,500.00$ 

Bulky Item Collection 131.25$         per hour No Bid No Bid

Year 3

Mechanical Arm Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 649,378.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 53,045.00$   No Bid 6,500.00$ 

Bulky Item Collection 137.81$         per hour No Bid No Bid

Year 4

Mechanical Arm Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 664,505.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 54,636.00$   No Bid 6,500.00$ 

Bulky Item Collection 144.70$         per hour No Bid No Bid

Year 5

Mechanical Arm Curbside Collection Solid Waste & Recyclables 680,086.00$ No Bid No Bid

Municipal Buildings Collection 56,275.00$   No Bid 6,500.00$ 

Bulky Item Collection 151.94$         per hour No Bid No Bid

2 of 2
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